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After ousting former president of Egypt Hasni Mubarak in
early 2011, Egyptians were left in a state of uncertainty.
The country’s first post-revolutionary elections, which
wauld start nine manths later on November 28th, wauld
represent the country’s interest in pursuing a democratic
government. Although the fervor during the 18-day
revolution was strong, many Egyptians were left unsure of
the process and inteqrity of the poll. Adding to the.
confusion, the military has aggressively tried to stake a
claim in Egypt's post-revolutionary rule

On Friday, November 18th, ctivists took to Cairo’s Tahrir.
Square, demonstrating against the miltary rule and hoping
to educate civilians about the voting process. When police.
cleared the area of demanstratars the next day, the
clashes escalsted, lsading to over a thousand non-fats!
and dozens of fatal casualties. Maises Saman has been
documenting events in and around Cairo.
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After ousting former president of Egypt Hasni Mubarak in
early 2011, Egyptians were left in a state of uncertainty.
The country’s first post-revolutionary elections, which
wauld start nine manths later on November 28th, wauld
represent the country’s interest in pursuing a democratic
government. Although the fervor during the 18-day
revolution was strong, many Egyptians were left unsure of
the process and inteqrity of the poll. Adding to the.
confusion, the military has aggressively tried to stake a
claim in Egypt's post-revolutionary rule

On Friday, November 18th, ctivists took to Cairo’s Tahrir.
Square, demonstrating against the miltary rule and hoping
to educate civilians about the voting process. When police.
cleared the area of demanstratars the next day, the
clashes escalsted, lsading to over a thousand non-fats!
and dozens of fatal casualties. Maises Saman has been
documenting events in and around Cairo.
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After ousting former president of Egypt Hasni Mubarak in
early 2011, Egyptians were left in a state of uncertainty.
The country’s first post-revolutionary elections, which
wauld start nine manths later on November 28th, wauld
represent the country’s interest in pursuing a democratic
government. Although the fervor during the 18-day
revolution was strong, many Egyptians were left unsure of
the process and inteqrity of the poll. Adding to the.
confusion, the military has aggressively tried to stake a
claim in Egypt's post-revolutionary rule

On Friday, November 18th, ctivists took to Cairo’s Tahrir.
Square, demonstrating against the miltary rule and hoping
to educate civilians about the voting process. When police.
cleared the area of demanstratars the next day, the
clashes escalsted, lsading to over a thousand non-fats!
and dozens of fatal casualties. Maises Saman has been
documenting events in and around Cairo.
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After ousting former president of Egypt Hasni Mubarak in
bhotos agnu 2 early 2011, Egyptians were left in a state of uncertainty.
The country’s first post-revolutionary elections, which
wauld start nine manths later on November 28th, wauld
represent the country’s interest in pursuing a democratic
government. Although the fervor during the 18-day
revolution was strong, many Egyptians were left unsure of
the process and inteqrity of the poll. Adding to the.
confusion, the military has aggressively tried to stake a
claim in Egypt's post-revolutionary rule

On Friday, November 18th, ctivists took to Cairo’s Tahrir.
Square, demonstrating against the miltary rule and hoping
to educate civilians about the voting process. When police.
cleared the area of demanstratars the next day, the
clashes escalsted, lsading to over a thousand non-fats!
and dozens of fatal casualties. Maises Saman has been
documenting events in and around Cairo.
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After ousting former president of Egypt Hasni Mubarak in
early 2011, Egyptians were left in a state of uncertainty.
The country’s first post-revolutionary elections, which
wauld start nine manths later on November 28th, wauld
represent the country’s interest in pursuing a democratic
government. Although the fervor during the 18-day
revolution was strong, many Egyptians were left unsure of
the process and inteqrity of the poll. Adding to the.
confusion, the military has aggressively tried to stake a
claim in Egypt's post-revolutionary rule

On Friday, November 18th, ctivists took to Cairo’s Tahrir.
Square, demonstrating against the miltary rule and hoping
to educate civilians about the voting process. When police.
cleared the area of demanstratars the next day, the
clashes escalsted, lsading to over a thousand non-fats!
and dozens of fatal casualties. Maises Saman has been
documenting events in and around Cairo.
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After ousting former president of Egypt Hasni Mubarak in
early 2011, Egyptians were left in a state of uncertainty.
The country’s first post-revolutionary elections, which
wauld start nine manths later on November 28th, wauld
represent the country’s interest in pursuing a democratic
government. Although the fervor during the 18-day
revolution was strong, many Egyptians were left unsure of
the process and inteqrity of the poll. Adding to the.
confusion, the military has aggressively tried to stake a
claim in Egypt's post-revolutionary rule

On Friday, November 18th, ctivists took to Cairo’s Tahrir.
Square, demonstrating against the miltary rule and hoping
to educate civilians about the voting process. When police.
cleared the area of demanstratars the next day, the
clashes escalsted, lsading to over a thousand non-fats!
and dozens of fatal casualties. Maises Saman has been
documenting events in and around Cairo.
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After ousting former president of Egypt Hasni Mubarak in
early 2011, Egyptians were left in a state of uncertainty.
The country’s first post-revolutionary elections, which
wauld start nine manths later on November 28th, wauld
represent the country’s interest in pursuing a democratic
government. Although the fervor during the 18-day
revolution was strong, many Egyptians were left unsure of
the process and inteqrity of the poll. Adding to the.
confusion, the military has aggressively tried to stake a
claim in Egypt's post-revolutionary rule

On Friday, November 18th, ctivists took to Cairo’s Tahrir.
Square, demonstrating against the miltary rule and hoping
to educate civilians about the voting process. When police.
cleared the area of demanstratars the next day, the
clashes escalsted, lsading to over a thousand non-fats!
and dozens of fatal casualties. Maises Saman has been
documenting events in and around Cairo.
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After ousting former president of Egypt Hasni Mubarak in
early 2011, Egyptians were left in a state of uncertainty.
The country’s first post-revolutionary elections, which
wauld start nine manths later on November 28th, wauld
represent the country’s interest in pursuing a democratic
government. Although the fervor during the 18-day
revolution was strong, many Egyptians were left unsure of
the process and inteqrity of the poll. Adding to the.
confusion, the military has aggressively tried to stake a
claim in Egypt's post-revolutionary rule

On Friday, November 18th, ctivists took to Cairo’s Tahrir.
Square, demonstrating against the miltary rule and hoping
to educate civilians about the voting process. When police.
cleared the area of demanstratars the next day, the
clashes escalsted, lsading to over a thousand non-fats!
and dozens of fatal casualties. Maises Saman has been
documenting events in and around Cairo.







